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“NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY RIGHTS: IF YOU ARE A NATURAL PERSON, YOU
MAY REMOVE OR STRIKE ANY OF THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION FROM THIS
INSTRUMENT BEFORE IT IS FILED FOR RECORD IN THE PUBLIC RECORDS: YOUR
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER OR YOUR DRIVER’S LICENSE NUMBER.”

TAX DEED
STATE OF TEXAS §
§
COUNTY OF LAMB §

WHEREAS, by a Warrant issued out of the 154" Judicial District Court of Lamb County, Texas;
in Cause No. DCU-19989-18 styled City of Littlefield, et al, vs. Owners of Various Properties
located within the City Limits of Littlefield, TX, and delivered to the Sheriff directing him to
seize, levy upon and sell the hereinafter described property to satisfy the amount of all delinquent
taxes, penalties, interest and costs which were secured by a judgment rendered in said cause on
the 24th day of August, 2018, in favor of the Plaintiffs.

WHEREAS, in obedience to said Warrant, the Sheriff did seize and levy on the hercinafter
described property and all the estate, right, title and interest or claims which said Defendants so
had, in and to, on the 24th day of August, 2018 and since that time had of, in and to, the
hereinafter described real property; and as prescribed by law for Sheriff's sales, did offer to sell
such real property at public auction.

WHEREAS, at said sale no bid being received which was equal to the adjudged value of said
real property as fixed by said court or the aggregate amount of said warrant established therein,
the title to said real property pursuant to said warrant and Section 34.01 of the Texas Property
Tax Code was struck off in trust for the use and benefit of each taxing district having been by
said warrant adjudged to have valid tax liens against such real property, and

NOW, THEREFORE, KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that the taxing entities set
forth in the warrant in said cause, pursuant to the provisions of Section 34.05 of the Texas
Property Tax Code, for and in consideration of the sum of THREE HUNDRED EIGHTY
DOLLARS AND 00/100 ($380.00), said amount being the highest and best offer received from
Holland D. Kirby, P.O. Box 1028, Levelland, TX 79336, receipt of which is hereby
acknowledged, and by these presents do convey, expressly subject to the right of redemption by
the Defendants in said tax suit as provided by Section 34.21 of the Texas Property Tax Code, and
further subject to all presently recorded and validly existing restrictions, reservations, covenants,
conditions, easements, oil and gas leases, mineral interests, and water interests outstanding in
persons other than Grantor, and other instruments, other than conveyances of the surface fee
estate, that affect the Property, all the right, title and interest as was acquired by the taxing
entities through foreclosure the certain tract of land described as follows:

Lot Eight (8), in Block Two (2) of the Dalmont Subdivision, out of Block Two (2) of the
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WHEREAS this conveyance is also subject to the following Fee Simple Determinable Condition:

Grantee will do everything necessary to bring the Property into compliance with all state and
local codes within six months of the execution date of this deed. An affidavit stating that the
condition has been fulfilled, filed within six months of said date, if not contradicted by a
recorded statement filed within the same six months, is conclusive evidence that the condition
has been satisfied, and Grantee and third parties may rely on it.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the above described property unto the named purchaser Holland D.
Kirby, his/her heirs, successors and assigns forever, free and clear of all liens for ad valorem
taxes against such property delinquent at the time of warrant to all taxing units which were a
party of said Warrant and as fully and absolutely as the entities named below can convey the
above described real property by virtue of said judgment and Order of Sale and said Section
34.05 of the Texas Property Tax Code.

GRANTEE IS TAKING THE PROPERTY IN AN ARM’S-LENGTH AGREEMENT
BETWEEN THE PARTIES. THE CONSIDERATION WAS BARGAINED ON THE BASIS
OF AN “AS IS, WHERE IS” TRANSACTION AND REFLECTS THE AGREEMENT OF THE
PARTIES THAT THERE ARE NO REPRESENTATIONS OR EXPRESS OR IMPLIED
WARRANTIES. GRANTEE HAS NOT RELIED ON ANY INFORMATION OTHER THAN
GRANTEE’S INSPECTION.

GRANTEE RELEASES GRANTOR FROM LIABILITY FOR ENVIRONMENTAL
PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING LIABILITY (1) UNDER THE
COMPREHENSIVE ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE, COMPENSATION, AND LIABILITY
ACT (CERCLA), THE RESOURCE CONSERVATION AND RECOVERY ACT (RCRA),
THE TEXAS SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL ACT, AND THE TEXAS WATER CODE; OR (2)
ARISING AS THE RESULT OF THEORIES OF PRODUCT LIABILITY AND STRICT
LIABILITY, OR UNDER NEW LAWS OR CHANGES TO EXISTING LAWS ENACTED
AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE PURCHASE CONTRACT THAT WOULD
OTHERWISE IMPOSE ON GRANTORS IN THIS TYPE OF TRANSACTION NEW
LIABILITIES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY. THIS
RELEASE APPLIES EVEN WHEN THE ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING
THE PROPERTY RESULT FROM GRANTOR’S OWN NEGLIGENCE OR THE
NEGLIGENCE OF GRANTOR’S REPRESENTATIVE.

This tax deed may be executed in one or more counterparts, each one of which shall be deemed
an original, but all of which together shall constitute one and the same instrument.

L .. _
Page 2

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Holland D. Kirby, P.O. Box 1028, Levelland, TX 79336 (R18510)
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M By:

Eric Turpen, Mayor

City Sec

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the 2 } day of Aﬁﬂ / , ﬂ%y Eric

Turpen, Mayor, on behalf of CITY OF LITTLEFIELD in its capacity thefein stated.

Ooniws B/

Notary Pubfjc, State of Téxas

Ay, Tﬁjﬂﬂ/
Sy

GLYNNA JANINE BUTLER
Notary iD # 10738847

My Commission Expires
January 17, 2021

Page 3
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Holland D. Kirby, P.O. Box 1028, Levelland, TX 79336 (R18510)
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ATTEST:

County Clerk °

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the day of Q‘O@LQ ZO{ ¢ by

James M. DeLoach, County Judge, on behalf of LAMB COUNTY in its capacity therein stated

w

Page 4
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Holland D. Kirby, P.O. Box 1028, Levelland, TX 79336 (R18510)
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LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

./ Lance Bréadhufst’ Board President

ATTEST:

Board Secretary

- 2 .
This instrument was acknowledged before me onthe 6~ day of /] laved , A0, by
Lance Broadhurst, Board President, on behalf of LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
in its capacity therein stated.

Wewrblly Qorees)

Notary Public, State of Tekas

e P b e PP s et et ol Pt b et o

. _____________J
Page5

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Holland D. Kirby, P.O. Box 1028, Levelland, TX 79336 (R18510)
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: e
Jason Cﬂéman as General Manager

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the 27*” day of /M ARcH 2P(9 by
Jason Coleman as General Manager, on behalf of HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER
CONSERVATION DISTRICT in its capacity therein stated.

Y, i

Notary Public, State of Texas

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Holland D. Kirby, P.O. Box 1028, Levelland, TX 79336 (R18510)
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“NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY RIGHTS: IF YOU ARE A NATURAL PERSON, YOU
MAY REMOVE OR STRIKE ANY OF THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION FROM THIS
INSTRUMENT BEFORE IT IS FILED FOR RECORD IN THE PUBLIC RECORDS: YOUR
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER OR YOUR DRIVER’S LICENSE NUMBER.”

TAX DEED
STATE OF TEXAS §

COUNTY OF LAMB §

WHEREAS, by a Warrant issued out of the 154" Judicial District Court of Lamb County, Texas;
in Cause No. DCU-19989-18 styled City of Littlefield, et al, vs. Owners of Various Properties
located within the City Limits of Littlefield, TX, and delivered to the Sheriff directing him to
seize, levy upon and sell the hereinafter described property to satisfy the amount of all delinquent
taxes, penalties, interest and costs which were secured by a warrant rendered in said cause on the
24th day of August, 2018, in favor of the Plaintiffs.

WHEREAS, in obedience to said Warrant, the Sheriff did seize and levy on the hereinafter
described property and all the estate, right, title and interest or claims which said Defendants so
had, in and to, on the 24th day of August, 2018 and since that time had of, in and to, the
hereinafter described real property; and as prescribed by law for Sheriff's sales, did offer to sell
such real property at public auction.

WHEREAS, at said sale no bid being received which was equal to the adjudged value of said
real property as fixed by said court or the aggregate amount of said warrant established therein,
the title to said real property pursuant to said warrant and Section 34.01 of the Texas Property
Tax Code was struck off in trust for the use and benefit of each taxing district having been by
said warrant adjudged to have valid tax liens against such real property, and

NOW, THEREFORE, KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that the taxing entities set
forth in the warrant in said cause, pursuant to the provisions of Section 34.05 of the Texas
Property Tax Code, for and in consideration of the sum of ONE THOUSAND EIGHT
HUNDRED DOLLARS AND 00/100 ($1,800.00), said amount being the highest and best offer
received from Jonathan Salinas, 124 E. 23rd, Littlefield, TX 79399, receipt of which is hereby
acknowledged, and by these presents do convey, expressly subject to the right of redemption by
the Defendants in said tax suit as provided by Section 34.21 of the Texas Property Tax Code, and
further subject to all presently recorded and validly existing restrictions, reservations, covenants,
conditions, easements, oil and gas leases, mineral interests, and water interests outstanding in
persons other than Grantor, and other instruments, other than conveyances of the surface fee
estate, that affect the Property, all the right, title and interest as was acquired by the taxing
entities through foreclosure the certain tract of land described as follows:

Tract Three (3) out of the East half (E/2) of Lot Five (5), in Block Three (3), of the High

School Addition to the City of Littlefield, Lamb County, Texas., (R19239)
L ____]

Page 1
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
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WHEREAS this conveyance is also subject to the following Fee Simple Determinable Condition:

Grantee will do everything necessary to bring the Property into compliance with all state and
local codes within six months of the execution date of this deed. An affidavit stating that the
condition has been fulfilled, filed within six months of said date, if not contradicted by a
recorded statement filed within the same six months, is conclusive evidence that the condition
has been satisfied, and Grantee and third parties may rely on it.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the above described property unto the named purchaser Joanthan
Salinas, his/her heirs, successors and assigns forever, free and clear of all liens for ad valorem
taxes against such property delinquent at the time of warrant to all taxing units which were a
party of said Warrant and as fully and absolutely as the entities named below can convey the
above described real property by virtue of said judgment and Order of Sale and said Section
34.05 of the Texas Property Tax Code.

GRANTEE IS TAKING THE PROPERTY IN AN ARM’S-LENGTH AGREEMENT
BETWEEN THE PARTIES. THE CONSIDERATION WAS BARGAINED ON THE BASIS
OF AN “AS IS, WHERE IS” TRANSACTION AND REFLECTS THE AGREEMENT OF THE
PARTIES THAT THERE ARE NO REPRESENTATIONS OR EXPRESS OR IMPLIED
WARRANTIES. GRANTEE HAS NOT RELIED ON ANY INFORMATION OTHER THAN
GRANTEE’S INSPECTION.

GRANTEE RELEASES GRANTOR FROM LIABILITY FOR ENVIRONMENTAL
PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING LIABILITY (1) UNDER THE
COMPREHENSIVE ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE, COMPENSATION, AND LIABILITY
ACT (CERCLA), THE RESOURCE CONSERVATION AND RECOVERY ACT (RCRA),
THE TEXAS SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL ACT, AND THE TEXAS WATER CODE; OR (2)
ARISING AS THE RESULT OF THEORIES OF PRODUCT LIABILITY AND STRICT
LIABILITY, OR UNDER NEW LAWS OR CHANGES TO EXISTING LAWS ENACTED
AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE PURCHASE CONTRACT THAT WOULD
OTHERWISE IMPOSE ON GRANTORS IN THIS TYPE OF TRANSACTION NEW
LIABILITIES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY. THIS
RELEASE APPLIES EVEN WHEN THE ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING
THE PROPERTY RESULT FROM GRANTOR’S OWN NEGLIGENCE OR THE
NEGLIGENCE OF GRANTOR’S REPRESENTATIVE.

This tax deed may be executed in one or more counterparts, each one of which shall be deemed
an original, but all of which together shall constitute one and the same instrument.

. . _ ]
Page 2

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Jonathan Salinas, 124 E. 23rd, Littlefield, TX 79399 (R19239)
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XECUTED this .2 day of E!,@z 7 2010
/
( 7,

CITY OF LITTLEFIELD

> - c,
AS By: é:—B /‘—w—
Eric Turpen, Mayor
ATTESF: - A
Lol N
City SetTgiary ' :

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the Q/ ﬁ day of /4&% /

/7, vy Eric
Turpen, Mayor, on behalf of CITY OF LITTLEFIELD in its capacity therefn stated.

GLYNNA JANINE BUTLER

Notary 1D # 10738847

My Commission Expires
January 17, 2021

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Jonathan Salinas, 124 E. 23rd, Littlefield, TX 79399 (R19239)
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s M. DeLoach, County Judge

ATTEST:

County Clerk v

Z\)fq by

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the &day of /

James M. DeLoach, County Judge, on behalf of LAMB COUNTY in its cabacnty therein stated.
‘ i‘ﬂ'% 8&""‘[‘\

i MyNotyD# 125507508 |
& F.‘hs.luly 18 1022

s _ _____ ____ ___ __ ___ ___ ____ _____________ _ __ _____ __ __ __ ]
. Page4
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Jonathan Salinas, 124 E. 23rd, Littlefield, TX 79399 (R19239)
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LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

- By: /);’_Ljf%

¥ance Broadfurst, Board President

ATTEST: ;
/Cl’( r
Board Sec\rétary
~ 44 ;
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the J/¢ ! day of /) 0cve h , 2011, by

Lance Broadhurst, Board President, on behalf of LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
in its capacity therein stated.

Mace, o T ctd

Notary Pyblic, State of Texas

Lol ___________|]

Page5
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Jonathan Salinas, 124 E. 23rd, Littlefield, TX 79399 (R19239)
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By:

Jason ﬂoleman as General Manager

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the o 77" dayof /7AecH 2P19 , by
Jason Coleman as General Manager, on behalf of HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER
CONSERVATION DISTRIC in its capacity therein stated.

e (2t —

Notary Public, State of Texas

e,
~r e o

Page 6
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Jonathan Salinas, 124 E. 23rd, Littlefield, TX 79399 (R19239)
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FILED and certified as RECORDED in the
Official Public Records of Lamb County
Tonya Ritchie, County Clerk $46.00

“NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY RIGHTS: IF YOU ARE A NATURAL PERSON, YOU
MAY REMOVE OR STRIKE ANY OF THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION FROM THIS
INSTRUMENT BEFORE IT IS FILED FOR RECORD IN THE PUBLIC RECORDS: YOUR
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER OR YOUR DRIVER’S LICENSE NUMBER.”

TAX DEED
STATE OF TEXAS §

COUNTY OF LAMB §

WHEREAS, by a Warrant issued out of the 154" Judicial District Court of Lamb County, Texas;
in Cause No. DCU-19989-18 styled City of Littlefield, et al, vs. Owners of Various Properties
located within the City Limits of Littlefield, TX, and delivered to the Sheriff directing him to
seize, levy upon and sell the hereinafter described property to satisfy the amount of all delinquent
taxes, penalties, interest and costs which were secured by a warrant rendered in said cause on the
24th day of August, 2018, in favor of the Plaintiffs.

WHEREAS, in obedience to said Warrant, the Sheriff did seize and levy on the hereinafter
described property and all the estate, right, title and interest or claims which said Defendants so
had, in and to, on the 24th day of August, 2018 and since that time had of;, in and to, the
hereinafter described real property; and as prescribed by law for Sheriff's sales, did offer to sell
such real property at public auction.

WHEREAS, at said sale no bid being received which was equal to the adjudged value of said
real property as fixed by said court or the aggregate amount of said warrant established therein,
the title to said real property pursuant to said warrant and Section 34.01 of the Texas Property
Tax Code was struck off in trust for the use and benefit of each taxing district having been by
said warrant adjudged to have valid tax liens against such real property, and

NOW, THEREFORE, KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that the taxing entities set
forth in the warrant in said cause, pursuant to the provisions of Section 34.05 of the Texas
Property Tax Code, for and in consideration of the sum of SEVEN HUNDRED FIFTY
DOLLARS AND 00/100 ($750.00), said amount being the highest and best offer received from
Scott A. Miller, 5018 92nd St., Lubbock, TX 79424, receipt of which is hereby acknowledged,
and by these presents do convey, expressly subject to the right of redemption by the Defendants
in said tax suit as provided by Section 34.21 of the Texas Property Tax Code, and further subject
to all presently recorded and validly existing restrictions, reservations, covenants, conditions,
easements, oil and gas leases, mineral interests, and water interests outstanding in persons other
than Grantor, and other instruments, other than conveyances of the surface fee estate, that affect
the Property, all the right, title and interest as was acquired by the taxing entities through
foreclosure the certain tract of land described as follows:

T ndee Eaon 8\ O 4\ v d © e £y 2 DI ) T ™ L o T2 P e €L 3 d P L .
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WHEREAS this conveyance is also subject to the following Fee Simple Determinable Condition:

Grantee will do everything necessary to bring the Property into compliance with all state and
local codes within six months of the execution date of this deed. An affidavit stating that the
condition has been fulfilled, filed within six months of said date, if not contradicted by a
recorded statement filed within the same six months, is conclusive evidence that the condition
has been satisfied, and Grantee and third parties may rely on it.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the above described property unto the named purchaser Scott A.
Miller, his/her heirs, successors and assigns forever, free and clear of all liens for ad valorem
taxes against such property delinquent at the time of warrant to all taxing units which were a
party of said Warrant and as fully and absolutely as the entities named below can convey the
above described real property by virtue of said warrant and Order of Sale and said Section 34.05
of the Texas Property Tax Code.

GRANTEE IS TAKING THE PROPERTY IN AN ARM’S-LENGTH AGREEMENT
BETWEEN THE PARTIES. THE CONSIDERATION WAS BARGAINED ON THE BASIS
OF AN “AS IS, WHERE IS” TRANSACTION AND REFLECTS THE AGREEMENT OF THE
PARTIES THAT THERE ARE NO REPRESENTATIONS OR EXPRESS OR IMPLIED
WARRANTIES. GRANTEE HAS NOT RELIED ON ANY INFORMATION OTHER THAN
GRANTEE’S INSPECTION.

GRANTEE RELEASES GRANTOR FROM LIABILITY FOR ENVIRONMENTAL
PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING LIABILITY (1) UNDER THE
COMPREHENSIVE ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE, COMPENSATION, AND LIABILITY
ACT (CERCLA), THE RESOURCE CONSERVATION AND RECOVERY ACT (RCRA),
THE TEXAS SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL ACT, AND THE TEXAS WATER CODE; OR (2)
ARISING AS THE RESULT OF THEORIES OF PRODUCT LIABILITY AND STRICT
LIABILITY, OR UNDER NEW LAWS OR CHANGES TO EXISTING LAWS ENACTED
AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE PURCHASE CONTRACT THAT WOULD
OTHERWISE IMPOSE ON GRANTORS IN THIS TYPE OF TRANSACTION NEW
LIABILITIES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY. THIS
RELEASE APPLIES EVEN WHEN THE ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING
THE PROPERTY RESULT FROM GRANTOR’S OWN NEGLIGENCE OR THE
NEGLIGENCE OF GRANTOR’S REPRESENTATIVE.

This tax deed may be executed in one or more counterparts, each one of which shall be deemed
an original, but all of which together shall constitute one and the same instrument.
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EXECUTED this 23 day of /4/20%/ ,2019.

CITY OF LITTLEFIELD

By: &"S /.—3,\.,

Eric Turpen, Mayor

1
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the Q?: i day OM M%y Ernic

Turpen, Mayor, on behalf of CITY OF LITTLEFIELD in its capacity therein stated.

GLYNNA JANINE BUTLER..
Notary D # 10738847
My Commission Expires

January 17, 2021

, State of Texas
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LAMB COUNTY

ATTEST:

County Clerk )

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the éi l% day of ‘4\02;,0 , 7 q\by
James M. DeLoach, County Judge, on behalf of LAMB COUNTY in its capacity therein stated.
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LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Larfce Broadhurst, Boafd President

e .
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the / b day of /] Y44 } , 2019, by
Lance Broadhurst, Board President, on behalf of LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
in its capacity therein stated.

Notary Public, State of Texas 7

et
S\ MARY ELLEN RANGEL
3 Notary Public, Stete of Texas

iD¥ 7436064
wcumm:s'ym@mnm

Daca C
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HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER CONSERVATION DISTRICT

JasﬁColemaﬁ' as General Manager

- 4
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the 3r day of )4 PR ADITD, by
Jason Coleman as General Manager, on behalf of HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER
CONSERVATION DISTRICT in its capacity therein stated.

Ay (2 — oY) Moy, S o

i f Notary 1D# 3867712
Notary Public, State of Texas ==y Comaisson Expres 07-17-2022

B et




00200 0 O 0O
2019-00000649 5/1/2019 9:35 AM < LA,
Volume 777 Page 252 £

~ FILED and certified as RECORDED in the 8

Official Public Records of Lamb County
Tonya Ritchie, County Clerk $46.00

“NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY RIGHTS: IF YOU ARE A NATURAL PERSON, YOU
MAY REMOVE OR STRIKE ANY OF THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION FROM THIS
INSTRUMENT BEFORE IT IS FILED FOR RECORD IN THE PUBLIC RECORDS: YOUR
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER OR YOUR DRIVER'’S LICENSE NUMBER.”

TAX DEED
STATE OF TEXAS §

COUNTY OF LAMB §

WHEREAS, by a Warrant issued out of the 154 Judicial District Court of Lamb County, Texas;
in Cause No. DCU-19989-18 styled City of Littlefield, et al, vs. Owners of Various Properties
located within the City Limits of Littlefield, TX, and delivered to the Sheriff directing him to
seize, levy upon and sell the hereinafter described property to satisfy the amount of all delinquent
taxes, penalties, interest and costs which were secured by a warrant rendered in said cause on the
24th day of August, 2018, in favor of the Plaintiffs.

WHEREAS, in obedience to said Warrant, the Sheriff did seize and levy on the hereinafter
described property and all the estate, right, title and interest or claims which said Defendants so
had, in and to, on the 24th day of August, 2018 and since that time had of, in and to, the
hereinafter described real property; and as prescribed by law for Sheriff's sales, did offer to sell
such real property at public auction.

WHEREAS, at said sale no bid being received which was equal to the adjudged value of said
real property as fixed by said court or the aggregate amount of said warrant established therein,
the title to said real property pursuant to said warrant and Section 34.01 of the Texas Property
Tax Code was struck off in trust for the use and benefit of each taxing district having been by
said warrant adjudged to have valid tax liens against such real property, and

NOW, THEREFORE, KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that the taxing entities set
forth in the warrant in said cause, pursuant to the provisions of Section 34.05 of the Texas
Property Tax Code, for and in consideration of the sum of TWO THOUSAND FIVE
HUNDRED FIFTY-TWO DOLLARS AND 00/100 ($2,552.00), said amount being the highest
and best offer received from Martin and Rosa Torrez, 415 Western Ave., Lot 67, Faribault,
MN 55021, receipt of which is hereby acknowledged, and by these presents do convey, expressly
subject to the right of redemption by the Defendants in said tax suit as provided by Section 34.21
of the Texas Property Tax Code, and further subject to all presently recorded and validly existing
restrictions, reservations, covenants, conditions, easements, oil and gas leases, mineral interests,
and water interests outstanding in persons other than Grantor, and other instruments, other than
conveyances of the surface fee estate, that affect the Property, all the right, title and interest as
was acquired by the taxing entities through foreclosure the certain tract of land described as

follows:

All of Lots Eleven (11) and Twelve (12) in Block No. Twenty-six (26) of the Original Town
of Littlefield, in Lamb County, Texas. (R19956)

- ___ ___ .. __ __ _  ____ _ ______ _ _ _ __ __ ____ ____ __ ______ ________________ _______ _____ ____________ ___________]
Page 1

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
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WHEREAS this conveyance is also subject to the following Fee Simple Determinable Condition:

Grantee will do everything necessary to bring the Property into compliance with all state and
local codes within six months of the execution date of this deed. An affidavit stating that the
condition has been fulfilled, filed within six months of said date, if not contradicted by a
recorded statement filed within the same six months, is conclusive evidence that the condition
has been satisfied, and Grantee and third parties may rely on it.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the above described property unto the named purchaser Martin or
Rosa Torrez, his/her heirs, successors and assigns forever, free and clear of all liens for ad
valorem taxes against such property delinquent at the time of warrant to all taxing units which
were a party of said Warrant and as fully and absolutely as the entities named below can convey
the above described real property by virtue of said warrant and Order of Sale and said Section
34.05 of the Texas Property Tax Code.

GRANTEE IS TAKING THE PROPERTY IN AN ARM’S-LENGTH AGREEMENT
BETWEEN THE PARTIES. THE CONSIDERATION WAS BARGAINED ON THE BASIS
OF AN “AS IS, WHERE IS” TRANSACTION AND REFLECTS THE AGREEMENT OF THE
PARTIES THAT THERE ARE NO REPRESENTATIONS OR EXPRESS OR IMPLIED
WARRANTIES. GRANTEE HAS NOT RELIED ON ANY INFORMATION OTHER THAN
GRANTEE’S INSPECTION.

GRANTEE RELEASES GRANTOR FROM LIABILITY FOR ENVIRONMENTAL
PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING LIABILITY (1) UNDER THE
COMPREHENSIVE ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE, COMPENSATION, AND LIABILITY
ACT (CERCLA), THE RESOURCE CONSERVATION AND RECOVERY ACT (RCRA),
THE TEXAS SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL ACT, AND THE TEXAS WATER CODE; OR (2)
ARISING AS THE RESULT OF THEORIES OF PRODUCT LIABILITY AND STRICT
LIABILITY, OR UNDER NEW LAWS OR CHANGES TO EXISTING LAWS ENACTED
AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE PURCHASE CONTRACT THAT WOULD
OTHERWISE IMPOSE ON GRANTORS IN THIS TYPE OF TRANSACTION NEW
LIABILITIES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY. THIS
RELEASE APPLIES EVEN WHEN THE ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING
THE PROPERTY RESULT FROM GRANTOR’S OWN NEGLIGENCE OR THE
NEGLIGENCE OF GRANTOR'S REPRESENTATIVE.

This tax deed may be executed in one or more counterparts, each one of which shall be deemed
an original, but all of which together shall constitute one and the same instrument.

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Martin and Rosa Torrez, 415 Western Ave., Lot 67, Faribault, MN 55021 (R19956)
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EXECUTED this =23 day of &M L 200,
/

17} )
CITY OF LITTLEFIELD

by 3 T

Eric Turpen, Mayor

NG s /ﬁ//)ﬁ
. by Eric

%cretary
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the Q 5 day of /72 y ok /

gy

STTEER

City
Turpen, Mayor, on behalf of CITY OF LITTLEFIELD in its capacity therefh stated.

GLYNNA JANINE BUTLER
Notary 10 # 10738847

My Commission Expires
January 17, 2021

ic, State of Texas

. ]
Page 3
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Martin and Rosa Torrez, 415 Western Ave., Lot 67, Faribault, MN 55021 (R19956)



2019-00000649 4 0of 6

~

AMB COUNTY

- M

es M. DeLoach, County Judge
ATTEST: /

m?mﬂw

County Clerk

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the ?@day of ADP ;.,0 Zl)‘q by
CcO

James M. DeLoach, County Judge, on behalf of LAM UNTY in its c%pacny therein stated.

Notary Public, State of Texas

~-~~M.-~--~—\N-\.~W~~w-~~~-.~-»—w~\.-~~W~~~~\,-~--~~~~~-~m~--

S
‘ Page 4
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC

Tax Deed: Martin and Rosa Torrez, 415 Western Ave., Lot 67, Faribault, MN 55021 (R19956)
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LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

By: /’Mﬁ)

Lanyfbroadhulst, Board President

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the /¢ “ day of _ﬁ pori / 401, by

Lance Broadhurst, Board President, on behalf of LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
in its capacity therein stated.

Wasar o bprid

Notary Puﬁc, State of Texas ¥

Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Martin and Rosa Torrez, 415 Western Ave., Lot 67, Faribault, MN 55021 (R19956)
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HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER CONSERVATION DISTRICT

Jas oleman as General Manager

ad
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the 3 day of ﬁiﬂwf— =1 (7 9, by
Jason Coleman as General Manager, on behalf of HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER
CONSERVATION DISTRICT in its capacity therein stated.

2 @—‘—P 4 TAMMY ANDERSO
b4 6 m%sggtgu
Nofary Publiés State of Texas & 4 MyCom% B 0117222

Page 6
Approved in form by R. Douglas Jordan, PLLC
Tax Deed: Martin and Rosa Torrez, 415 Western Ave., Lot 67, Faribault, MN 55021 (R19956)
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FILED and certified as RECORDED in the
Official Public Records of Lamb County
Tonya Ritchie, County Clerk $46.00

“NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIALITY RIGHTS: IF YOU ARE A NATURAL PERSON, YOU
MAY REMOVE OR STRIKE ANY OF THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION FROM THIS
INSTRUMENT BEFORE IT IS FILED FOR RECORD IN THE PUBLIC RECORDS: YOUR
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER OR YOUR DRIVER’S LICENSE NUMBER.”

TAX DEED
STATE OF TEXAS §

COUNTY OF LAMB §

WHEREAS, by a Warrant issued out of the 154" Judicial District Court of Lamb County, Texas;
in Cause No. DCU-19989-18 styled City of Littlefield, et al, vs. Owners of Various Properties
located within the City Limits of Littlefield, TX, and delivered to the Sheriff directing him to
seize, levy upon and sell the hereinafter described property to satisfy the amount of all delinquent
taxes, penalties, interest and costs which were secured by a warrant rendered in said cause on the
24th day of August, 2018, in favor of the Plaintiffs.

WHEREAS, in obedience to said Warrant, the Sheriff did seize and levy on the hereinafter
described property and all the estate, right, title and interest or claims which said Defendants so
had, in and to, on the 24th day of August, 2018 and since that time had of, in and to, the
hereinafter described real property; and as prescribed by law for Sheriff's sales, did offer to sell
such real property at public auction.

WHEREAS, at said sale no bid being received which was equal to the adjudged value of said
real property as fixed by said court or the aggregate amount of said warrant established therein,
the title to said real property pursuant to said warrant and Section 34.01 of the Texas Property
Tax Code was struck off in trust for the use and benefit of each taxing district having been by
said warrant adjudged to have valid tax liens against such real property, and

NOW, THEREFORE, KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that the taxing entities set
forth in the warrant in said cause, pursuant to the provisions of Section 34.05 of the Texas
Property Tax Code, for and in consideration of the sum of ONE HUNDRED FIFTY
DOLLARS AND 00/100 ($150.00), said amount being the highest and best offer received from
Miller LFD Holdings, LLC, 5018 92nd St., Lubbock, TX 79424, receipt of which is hereby
acknowledged, and by these presents do convey, expressly subject to the right of redemption by
the Defendants in said tax suit as provided by Section 34.21 of the Texas Property Tax Code, and
further subject to all presently recorded and validly existing restrictions, reservations, covenants,
conditions, easements, oil and gas leases, mineral interests, and water interests outstanding in
persons other than Grantor, and other instruments, other than conveyances of the surface fee
estate, that affect the Property, all the right, title and interest as was acquired by the taxing
entities through foreclosure the certain tract of land described as follows:
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WHEREAS this conveyance is also subject to the following Fee Simple Determinable Condition:

Grantee will do everything necessary to bring the Property into compliance with all state and
local codes within six months of the execution date of this deed. An affidavit stating that the
condition has been fulfilled, filed within six months of said date, if not contradicted by a
recorded statement filed within the same six months, is conclusive evidence that the condition
has been satisfied, and Grantee and third parties may rely on it.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the above described property unto the named purchaser Scott A.
Miller, his/her heirs, successors and assigns forever, free and clear of all liens for ad valorem
taxes against such property delinquent at the time of warrant to all taxing units which were a
party of said Warrant and as fully and absolutely as the entities named below can convey the
above described real property by virtue of said warrant and Order of Sale and said Section 34.05
of the Texas Property Tax Code.

GRANTEE IS TAKING THE PROPERTY IN AN ARM’S-LENGTH AGREEMENT
BETWEEN THE PARTIES. THE CONSIDERATION WAS BARGAINED ON THE BASIS
OF AN “AS IS, WHERE IS” TRANSACTION AND REFLECTS THE AGREEMENT OF THE
PARTIES THAT THERE ARE NO REPRESENTATIONS OR EXPRESS OR IMPLIED
WARRANTIES. GRANTEE HAS NOT RELIED ON ANY INFORMATION OTHER THAN
GRANTEE'’S INSPECTION.

GRANTEE RELEASES GRANTOR FROM LIABILITY FOR ENVIRONMENTAL
PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING LIABILITY (1) UNDER THE
COMPREHENSIVE ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE, COMPENSATION, AND LIABILITY
ACT (CERCLA), THE RESOURCE CONSERVATION AND RECOVERY ACT (RCRA),
THE TEXAS SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL ACT, AND THE TEXAS WATER CODE; OR (2)
ARISING AS THE RESULT OF THEORIES OF PRODUCT LIABILITY AND STRICT
LIABILITY, OR UNDER NEW LAWS OR CHANGES TO EXISTING LAWS ENACTED
AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE PURCHASE CONTRACT THAT WOULD
OTHERWISE IMPOSE ON GRANTORS IN THIS TYPE OF TRANSACTION NEW
LIABILITIES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY. THIS
RELEASE APPLIES EVEN WHEN THE ENVIRONMENTAL PROBLEMS AFFECTING
THE PROPERTY RESULT FROM GRANTOR’S OWN NEGLIGENCE OR THE
NEGLIGENCE OF GRANTOR’S REPRESENTATIVE.

This tax deed may be executed in one or more counterparts, each one of which shall be deemed
an original, but all of which together shall constitute one and the same instrument.
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wniEXECUTED this 223 day of 4@ / , 2019.
<N

CITY OF LITTLEFIELD

By: &5 /"w'—'

Eric Turpen, Mayor

Sutlh—

Vit

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the X 3 day of ,ﬂfby Eric
Turpen, Mayor, on behalf of CITY OF LITTLEFIELD in its capacity tHerein stated.

Qs 5

Notary Byblic, State of Texas

GLYNNA JANINE
BT
Notary 1p » 107388':157“

My Commisslon Expires
Janvary 17, 2021
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L bl s

es >s M. Del.oach, County Judge

ATTEST:

County Clerk v

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the
James M. DeL.oach, County Judge, on behalf of LAM

(‘\ JAA G B)mmq,
Notary Public, State of Texas
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LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

.

Lange-Broadhurst, Board President

ATTEST: \
Board Secektary /

s /6" aay ot A 17
This instrument was acknowledged before me onthe /o day of /Tpy. } , AT by

Lance Broadhurst, Board President, on behalf of LITTLEFIELD INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
in its capacity therein stated.

Notary l'-@glic, State of Texas

o~
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R MARY ELLEN RANGEL
Nolary Publc, Stas of Texs
Notary ID¥ 713606+
My Conmission Expres 11-26-2°22
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HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER CONSERVATION DISTRICT

P A S S e A R A L A A A T A A e e

By:

oleman as General Manager

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the 30 day of Apﬂ. I HOIF, by
Jason Coleman as General Manager, on behalf of HIGH PLAINS UNDERGROUND WATER

CONSERVATION DISTRICT in its capacity therein stated.

%@-/"-—

Notary Pubfic, State of Texas

s



